AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1B

Union Calendar No. 82
e H,R. 1954

[Report No. 107-107, Parts I and II]

To extend the authorities of the Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of 1996
until 2006.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

May 23, 2001
Mr. GILMAN (for himself, Mr. BERMAN, Mr. ARMEY, Mr. GEPHARDT, Ms.
PRYCE of Ohio, Mr. LlaNTOS, Mr. Cox, Mr. ACKERMAN, Mr. BLUNT, Mr.
WaxmaN, Mr. ApeEroonT, Mr. ANDREWS, Mr. Baca, Mr. BArRD, Mr.
BAKER, Ms. BALDWIN, Mr. Bass, Mr. BECERRA, Mr. BENTSEN, Ms.
BERKLEY, Mr. BOEHLERT, Mrs. DBIGGERT, Mr. DBILIRAKIS, Mr.
BragoJevich, Mr. BoNILLA, Mrs. BoNo, Mr. Borski, Mr. Boyp, Mr.
BRrROWN of Ohio, Mr. BROWN of South Carolina, Mr. BRyanT, Mr. BUR-
TON of Indiana, Mr. BUYER, Mr. CALLAHAN, Mr. CANTOR, Mrs. CAPPS,
Mr. CARsSON of Oklahoma, Mr. CaApuaNO, Mr. CARDIN, Mr. COBLE, Mr.
Coxprr, Mr. CoSTELLO, Mr. CRENSHAW, Mr. CROWLEY, Mr. DAVIS of
Florida, Mrs. JO ANN DAVIS of Virginia, Mrs. DaAvIis of California, Mr.
Tom Davis of Virginia, Ms. DEGETTE, Mr. DEUTSCH, Mr. Diaz-
Bavarr, Mr. Doovirrine, Mr. DoyLe, Mr. EHLERS, Mr. ENGEL, Ms.
Esmoo, Mr. ETHERIDGE, Mr. Evans, Mr. FERGUSON, Mr. FILNER, Mr.
FLake, Mr. ForLey, Mr. ForD, Mr. FossenLrnaA, Mr. FRANK, Mr.
FRELINGHUYSEN, Mr. FrROST, Mr. GANSKE, Mr. GALLEGLY, Mr. GEKAS,
Mr. GILCHREST, Mr. GILLMOR, Mr. GONZALEZ, Mr. GORDON, Mr. GOSS,
Mr. GRAHAM, Ms. GRANGER, Mr. GRAVES, Mr. GRuccl, Mr. GUTIERREZ,
Mr. HASTINGS of Florida, Ms. HARMAN, Ms. HarT, Mr. HAYES, Mr.
HaywortH, Mr. HILLEARY, Mr. HOEFFEL, Mr. HoLt, Mr. HOLDEN,
Mr. Hoxpa, Ms. HOOLEY of Oregon, Mr. Horn, Mr. HOYER, Mr.
HUNTER, Mr. HUTCIHINSON, Mr. ISRAEL, Mr. Issa, Mrs. KELLY, Mr.
KENNEDY of Rhode Island, Mr. KinG, Mr. KiNnasToN, Mr. KirRK, Mr.
KNOLLENBERG, Mr. LANGEVIN, Mr. LAMPSON, Mr. LARSON of Con-
necticut, Mr. LATOURETTE, Mr. Lract, Ms. Lrr, Mr. LeVIN, Mr.
LEwts of Georgia, Mr. Lrpinski, Mr. LoBronpo, Mrs. Lowry, Mrs.
McCarTIY of New York, Ms. McCArTiIY of Missouri, Mr. MCCRERY,
Mr. McGOVERN, Mr. McInNis, Mr. McKroN, Mr. McNunty, Mrs.



2

MALONEY of New York, Mr. MARKEY, Mr. MascArA, Mr. MaTsul, Mr.
MEeEKS of New York, Mr. MENENDEZ, Mr. Mrica, Ms. MILLENDER-
McDoNALD, Mr. MILLER of Florida, Mr. GEORGE MILLER of California,
Mrs. MORELLA, Mr. MurtTHA, Mrs. MYRICK, Mr. NADLER, Mrs.
Norruur, Mr. NorwooD, Mr. Osg, Mr. OTTER, Mr. OWENS, Mr.
PALLONE, Mr. PASCRELL, Mr. PAsTOR, Ms. PELOSI, Mr. PHELprs, Mr.
Prrrs, Mr. Prarrs, Mr. PurNaM, Mr. RAMSTAD, Mr. RENIBERG, Mr.
ReEyNOLDS, Mr. RILEY, Ms. RIvErs, Mr. RODRIGUEZ, Mr. RoOIR-
ABACIIER, Mr. ROGERS of Michigan, Ms. Ros-LEOTINEN, Mr. ROTIIMAN,
Mrs. ROUKEMA, Mr. RYUN of Kansas, Mr. SABO, Mr. SANDLIN, Mr.
SAXTON, Mr. SCARBOROUGI, Ms. SCHAKOWSKY, Mr. Sciirr, Mr.
SCHROCK, Mr. SESSIONS, Mr. SHaw, Mr. SHADEGG, Mr. SHHERMAN, Mr.
StHows, Mr. SIMMONS, Mr. SKELTON, Ms. SLAUGHTER, Mr. SMITH of
New Jersey, Ms. Sownts, Mr. SOUDER, Mr. SPENCE, Mr. STEARNS, Mr.
STtuMP, Mr. STUPAK, Mr. SWEENEY, Mr. TANNER, Mrs. TAUSCIIER, Mr.
TavziN, Mr. TERRY, Mr. THOMPSON of California, Mrs. THURMAN, Mr.
TIBERI, Mr. UDALL of New Mexico, Mr. UNDERWOOD, Mr. VISCLOSKY,
Mr. ViTTER, Mr. WaMP, Mr. WEINER, Mr. WELDON of Florida, Mr.
WELDON of Pennsylvania, Mr. WELLER, Mr. WEXLER, Mr. WICKER, Ms.
WooLsey, Mr. Wu, and Mr. YOUNG of Alaska) introduced the following
bill; which was referred to the Committee on International Relations, and
in addition to the Committees on Financial Services, Ways and Means,
and Government Reform, for a period to be subsequently determined by
the Speaker, in each case for consideration of such provisions as fall with-
in the jurisdiction of the committee concerned

JUNE 22, 2001
Reported from the Committee on International Relations with an amendment

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

JUNE 22, 2001
Referral to the Committees on Financial Services, Ways and Means, and
Government Reform for a period ending not later than July 13, 2001

JuLy 13, 2001
Referral to the Committees on Financial Services, Ways and Means, and
Government Reform for a period ending not later than July 16, 2001

JuLy 16, 2001
Additional sponsors: Mr. Bacitus, Mr. Barpacct, Ms. BROWN of Florida, Mr.
DAVIs of llinois, Mr. FARR of California, Mr. MEEHAN, Ms. VELAZQUEZ,
Mr. CHAaMBLISS, Mr. BURR of North Carolina, Mr. CALVERT, Mr.
CRAMER, Mr. KELLER, Mr. KENNEDY of Minnesota, Mr. Ross, Mrs.
CusiN, Mr. Camp, Mr. PICKERING, Mrs. MEEK of Florida, Mr. UDALL
of Colorado, Mr. DEAL of Georgia, Mr. GREEN of Texas, Mr. LARSEN
of Washington, Mr. MarmesoN, Mr. CLEMENT, Mr. NUSSLE, Mr.
LatoaMm, Mr. HEFLEY, Ms. DELAURO, Mr. WoLr, Mr. LINDER, Mr.
BRrRADY of Pennsylvania, Mr. KILDEE, Mr. MALONEY of Connecticut, Mrs.
MiINK of Hawaii, Mr. GREENWOOD, Mr. ABERCROMBIE, Mr. PETERSON
of Pennsylvania, Mr. Tiaurt, Mr. UpTOoN, Mr. YOUNG of Florida, Mr.

*HR 1954 RH



Q
(3}

Suays, Mr. McINTYRE, Mr. RyaN of Wisconsin, Mr. GREEN of Wis-
consin, Mr. Liucas of Kentucky, and Mr. MOORE

JuLy 16, 2001
Reported from the Committee on Ways and Means with amendments

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in boldface roman]

JuLy 16, 2001
The Committee on Financial Services and the Committee on Government Re-
form discharged; committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the
State of the Union and ordered to be printed

A BILL

To extend the authorities of the Iran and Libya Sanctions
Act of 1996 until 2006.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTHION 1= SHORT TITEE:
of 2004
SECG: 2: EXTENSION OF IRAN AND EIBYA SANCTIONS ACT OF

1996:

© 00 N O O b~ W N P

11 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
12 This Act may be cited as the “ILSA Extension Act
13 of 2001

*HR 1954 RH



© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

N DN N N N DN P PP PP P PP PPk
o A W N P O © 0 N O O b W N B+ O

4
SEC. 2. IMPOSITION OF SANCTIONS WITH RESPECT TO

LIBYA.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 5(b)(2) of the Iran and
Libya Sanctions Act of 1996 (50 U.S.C. 1701 note; 110
Stat. 1543) 1is amended by striking “$40,000,000” each
place it appears and inserting “$20,000,000”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by sub-
section (a) shall apply to investments made on or after June
13, 2001.

SEC. 3. EXTENSION OF IRAN AND LIBYA SANCTIONS ACT OF
1996.

Section 13(b) of the Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of
1996 (50 U.S.C. 1701 note; Public Law 104—172) is amend-
ed by striking “5 years” and inserting “10 years”.

SEC. 4. REVISED DEFINITION OF INVESTMENT.

Section 14(9) of the Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of
1996 (50 U.S.C. 1701 note; 110 Stat. 1549) is amended
by adding at the end the following new sentence: “For pur-
poses of this paragraph, an amendment or other modifica-
tion that 1is made, on or after June 13, 2001, to an agree-
ment or contract shall be treated as the entry of an agree-
ment or contract.”.

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “ILSA Exten-

sion Act of 2001”.

*HR 1954 RH



5

1 SEC. 2. REPORTS REQUIRED.

2 Section 10 of the Iran and Libya Sanctions
3 Act of 1996 (Public Law 104-172; 50 U.S.C. 1701
4 note) is amended—

5 (1) by redesignating subsection (b) as
6 subsection (c¢); and

7 (2) by inserting after subsection (a)

8 the following:

9 “(b) REPORT ON EFFECTIVENESS OF ACTIONS
10 UNDER THIS AcT.—Not later than 18 months
11 after the date of the enactment of the ILSA
12 Extension Act of 2001, the President shall
13 transmit to Congress a report that describes—

14 “(1) the extent to which actions relat-

15 ing to trade taken pursuant to this Act—

16 “(A) have been effective in achiev-
17 ing the objectives of section 3 and
18 any other foreign policy or national
19 security objectives of the United
20 States with respect to Iran and Libya;
21 and

22 “(B) have affected humanitarian
23 interests in Iran and Libya, the coun-
24 try in which the sanctioned person is

25 located, or in other countries; and

*HR 1954 RH



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

6
“(2) the impact of actions relating to
trade taken pursuant to this Act on other
national security, economic, and foreign
policy interests of the United States, in-
cluding relations with countries friendly
to the United States, and on the United

States economy.”.

SEC. 3. EXTENSION OF IRAN AND LIBYA SANCTIONS ACT OF
1996.

Section 13(b) of the Iran and Libya Sanc-
tions Act of 1996 (Public Law 104-172; 50
U.S.C. 1701 note) is amended by striking “5
years” and inserting “10 years”.

SEC. 4. RESOLUTION TO TERMINATE IRAN AND LIBYA
SANCTIONS ACT OF 1996.

The Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of 1996
(Public Law 104-172; 50 U.S.C. 1701 note) is
amended by inserting after section 13 the fol-
lowing:

“SEC. 13A. RESOLUTION TO TERMINATE ACT.

“(a) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding sec-
tion 13(b) of this Act, at any time after the
date on which the report described in section

10(b) is transmitted to Congress, this Act shall

*HR 1954 RH



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

e A < e
o M W N B O

7
cease to be effective if a joint resolution de-
scribed in subsection (b) is enacted into law.

“(b) JOINT RESOLUTION DESCRIBED.—For
purposes of this section, the term ‘joint reso-
lution’ means only a joint resolution of the
two Houses of Congress, the matter after the
resolving clause of which is as follows: ‘That
the Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of 1996 (50
U.S.C 1701 note; Public Law 104-172) shall
cease to be effective beginning on the date of
the enactment of this joint resolution.’.

“(c) PROCEDURES IN HOUSE AND SENATE.—
The provisions of subsections (b) through (f)
of section 152 of the Trade Act of 1974 shall
apply to a joint resolution described in this
section.”.

Amend the title so as to read: “A bill to extend the
authorities of the Iran and Libya Sanctions Act of 1996

until 2006, and for other purposes.”.

*HR 1954 RH



Union Calendar No. 82

107TH CONGRESS
LGN HLR. 1954

[Report No. 107-107, Parts I and II]

A BILL

To extend the authorities of the Iran and Libya
Sanctions Act of 1996 until 2006.

JuLy 16, 2001

Reported from the Committee on Ways and Means with
amendments

Juny 16, 2001

The Committee on Financial Services and the Committee
on Government Reform discharged; committed to the
Committee of the Whole House on the State of the
Union and ordered to be printed



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-15T19:12:43-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




